Ref: 2020/003 (Extract)

Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002
Subject: Housing Waiting Times

Request:

| would like the following information:
1.

The average waiting time for housing accommodation, broken down by

bedroom number, in each of the last ten years.

The average waiting time for housing accommodation in each geographical
area, broken down by bedroom number, in each of the last ten years.

The longest waiting time for housing accommodation, broken down by

bedroom number, in each of the last ten years.

The longest waiting time for housing accommaodation in each geographical
area, broken down by bedroom number, in each of the last ten years.

Response:

The information requested is provided below.

1. The average waiting time for housing accommodation, broken down by

bedroom number, in each of the last ten years.

Average One Two Three Four

Waiting Time | Bedroom Bedroom Bedroom Bedroom
(Financial Property Property Property Property
Year) (Days) (Days) (Days) (Days)
2009-2010 Not Available | Not Available | Not Available | Not Available
2010-2011 Not Available | Not Available | Not Available | Not Available
2011-2012 Not Available | Not Available | Not Available | Not Available
2012-2013 Not Available | Not Available | Not Available | Not Available
2013-2014 Not Available | Not Available | Not Available | Not Available
2014-2015 706 198 273 768
2015-2016 778 457 325 3,012
2016-2017 399 382 852 485
2017-2018 581 334 447 n/a
2018-2019 837 470 628 774
2019 (Year 1,172 238 404 n/a
to Date)

Information provided is for applicants who were allocated housing
accommodation by Rosehill Housing Co-operative Limited.

We do not hold copies of our waiting list for financial years prior to 2014-2015.

Financial Years run from 1st October to 30th September.



2. The average waiting time for housing accommodation in each geographical

area, broken down by bedroom number, in each of the last ten years.

As above (Q1). All of our properties are located in Greater Pollok (G53

Postcode Area).

. The longest waiting time for housing accommodation, broken down by

bedroom number, in each of the last ten years.

Longest One Two Three Four

Waiting Time | Bedroom Bedroom Bedroom Bedroom
(Financial Property Property Property Property
Year) (Days) (Days) (Days) (Days)
2009-2010 Not Available | Not Available | Not Available | Not Available
2010-2011 Not Available | Not Available | Not Available | Not Available
2011-2012 Not Available | Not Available | Not Available | Not Available
2012-2013 Not Available | Not Available | Not Available | Not Available
2013-2014 Not Available | Not Available | Not Available | Not Available
2014-2015 1,451 840 492 1,228
2015-2016 2,940 766 567 3,012
2016-2017 697 1,597 1,301 860
2017-2018 1,553 1,441 987 n/a
2018-2019 2,750 1,811 2,862 1,553
2019 (Year 1,774 521 939 n/a
to Date)

Information provided is for applicants who were allocated housing
accommodation by Rosehill Housing Co-operative Limited.

We do not hold copies of our waiting list for financial years prior to 2014-2015.

Financial Years run from 1st October to 30th September.

. The longest waiting time for housing accommodation in each geographical
area, broken down by bedroom number, in each of the last ten years.

As above (Q3). All of our properties are located in Greater Pollok (G53

Postcode Area).



